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to live 14 fewer years than somebody born in the United States". 

Our Prime Minister Dr. Manmohan Singh had once remarked, "The slow improvement in the health 
status of our people has been a matter of great concern. We have paid inadequate attention to public 
health." This underscores the fact that the government requires a strong support from the private sector, 
the philanthropic institutions and individuals to ensure better human development, not just restricted to 
the area of health. 

In India, we have always looked forward for social support from the government. We feel that it is the 
responsibility of the government alone. This led to insufficient partnership between philanthropic 
organizations, government and the private sector. However, with the contribution of the state owned 
enterprises less than 22% of the total industrial output of the nation, private sector has a major role to 
play in extending support to the social causes. 

Role of the Indian private sector should not be just restricted in addressing events of despair; they 
should bring about a full development process of planned change, aimed at lasting improvements in the 
quality of lives of people at large. Participation by private sector would infuse professionalism in the 
philanthropic efforts expended and in measuring the impact of the efforts. 

Key challenge faced by several philanthropic organizations and foundations, worldwide, is the 
difficulty in measuring their output or quantifying the impact they create. As Harvard professors 
Michael Porter and Mark Kramer say: "Concerted effort, through secular charitable foundations has to 
go well beyond the gifts of private donors. They should achieve a social impact disproportionate to 
their spending''. 

Role of private sector in philanthropy management 

Globally, business groups which have created philanthropic organizations have brought in the essential 
governance mechanisms, stronger financial management systems and performance management 
systems. 

Accountability and transparency also encourage more people to contribute. Confidence in the 
governance of a philanthropic foundation benefits both the supply side (donor side) and the demand 
side (recipient) of the foundation. For example, Bill and Melinda Gates foundation measures the impact 
created by its important programs, provides management discussion and analysis and governance 
structure in its annual report. Commitment of over $30 billion by the legendary investor Warren Buffet 
to this foundation is the consequence of the confidence vested in this foundation on account of its 
transparency. 

Acknowledging individuals 

World over, great social changes have been brought forth by individuals, who, with absolute 
pragmatism, improved the quality of life and the human development of a large number of people in a 
concerted and consistent manner. It is our obligation to identify such men and women, who did not 
blame anyone for social problems facing the less fortunate, did not turn a blind-eye to them, but 
overcame the challenges single-handedly with creative solutions. 

We should know what they are doing, why they are doing it, and how to collaborate with them to make 
it happen. We should know the values of these selfless individuals, and the important role they are 
playing in improving people's lives. We should understand the meaning of sacrifice in the true sense of 
the word. We should understand the impact they have brought in. 

Conclusion 

I am sure that the awardees would continue to intensely focus on the collective good of the world. Their 
deeds will continue to inspire all of us and the awards would stand testimony to the values propagated 
by people like Jamnalalji and Jankideviji, who as true Gandhians, transcended the attractions of their 
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